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Manchester United have confirmed the signing of Slovenian striker Benjamin Sesko,
marking a significant step in the club’s efforts to rebuild its squad ahead of the new season.
The transfer, reported to be worth over £70 million, sees Sesko move to Old Trafford from
RB Leipzig, with the Red Devils reportedly outpacing Premier League rivals Newcastle
United to secure his signature.

Manchester United Secures Sesko as
Transfer Window Intensifies

—



The club has been actively strengthening its attacking options this summer. Sesko joins
fellow new signings Matheus Cunha and Bryan Mbeumo, both of whom arrived with the
expectation of enhancing United’s offensive capabilities. Sesko’s addition is viewed as a
move to bring fresh energy and goal-scoring potential to a team eager to reclaim its place
among English and European football’s elite.

Ruben Amorim, the former Sporting Lisbon manager recently appointed to guide
Manchester United’s rebuilding process, has played a pivotal role in attracting Sesko to the
club. The striker has spoken positively about Amorim’s vision and the atmosphere at the
club, highlighting these as key factors influencing his decision.

“When we discussed the project, it was clear that everything is in place for this team to
continue to grow and compete for major trophies,” Sesko said. “From the moment I arrived, I
felt the positive energy and family atmosphere the club has created. It is the perfect place
for me to reach my full potential and achieve my ambitions.”

Amorim’s impact is evident not only in player recruitment but also in the ongoing squad
reshaping. Several fringe players, including notable names such as Jadon Sancho,
Alejandro Garnacho, and Antony, have yet to secure moves away from the club. Managing
these high-wage players and creating room for new arrivals is an essential part of the
manager’s strategy moving forward.

In addition to strengthening the attack, Manchester United is also considering bolstering its
midfield. Brighton & Hove Albion’s Carlos Baleba has been linked with a move to Old
Trafford, though the player himself has expressed no desire to leave Brighton this summer.
Brighton, who are in no immediate need to sell, are expected to hold firm on any transfer
bids for the promising midfielder.

The transfer window remains open, and Manchester United’s activity reflects their ambition
to build a competitive squad capable of challenging for trophies in both domestic and
European competitions. The club’s supporters will be hopeful that these signings and
strategic moves signal a return to form after a period of transition.

With Ruben Amorim at the helm, the club aims to foster a positive and winning environment
that can attract and develop talent, restore confidence, and bring success back to Old
Trafford. Sesko’s arrival, alongside other new signings, represents an important step in that
direction.



As the summer transfer window progresses, attention will turn to how quickly the new
signings adapt and integrate into the squad. Manchester United’s fans will be keen to see
the team translate these off-field moves into on-field success in the coming season.


